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Preface 

The true foundation of this book project was my failure to find ‘so­
cialism’ in France in 1984! As a young American university student 
and social democrat, disgusted with the constraints of American po­
litical dialogue in the 1980s, I was determined to find real democratic 
socialism in the aftermath of the French Socialist Party’s victory in 
1981. However, by the time I arrived in 1984 for an academic year in 
Paris, Mitterrand had already abandoned most of the Keynesian 
reflationary economic strategies that had been put in place in 1981–2 
and was beginning to embrace the idea of Europe. Global and Euro­
pean forces, combined with French domestic politics, had overrun the 
Mitterrand socialist strategy. Two questions were increasingly appar­
ent to me and much of the West European left. Could social democ­
racy exist in any one country? If not, could it reassert itself through 
the European Community? 

Following a year at the University of Essex, I found myself, through 
a combination of academic interest and fate, working in the last bas­
tion of traditional social democracy in Western Europe in the late 1980s 
– Scandinavia, specifically Norway. State budgets were still massive, 
workers’ rights incredible, social policy universal and lavish, and 
hegemonic social democratic parties dominated the political process. 
Nevertheless, traditional Scandinavian social democracy was increas­
ingly being pressured externally and transformed internally. During 
the late 1980s in Scandinavia, traditional Keynesian strategies were 
increasingly abandoned, state expenditure constrained and the expan­
sion of the public sector curtailed. A key element of this transforma­
tion was the relationship of Scandinavian social democrats to the 
European Community. For ‘modernizing’ social democrats, abandon-
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ing traditional strategies and linking to the emerging EC were neces­
sary responses to Europeanization and globalization. Traditional na­
tional-level social democracy was dead. The best one could hope for 
was some type of Euro-social democracy. Traditional social demo­
crats strongly opposed this thinking and in the early 1990s the two 
sides fought each other ferociously over the issue of membership in 
the European Union, the Swedes voting to join and the Norwegians to 
stay out in 1994. 

I was fascinated by this political battle and the interplay between 
the ‘modernization’ of social democratic parties and their relation­
ships to the EU. I spent several years working on this issue while I was 
a PhD student at the University of Wisconsin, and subsequently pub­
lished a number of works on it.1 In essence, the fate of these battles 
hinged on the answers to the questions of the early 1980s. However, 
as with most political questions, there was no clear answer. On the 
one hand, traditional national-level Keynesian economic controls had 
been lost, but national-level welfare states and social policies remained 
remarkably resilient to radical change. On the other, European inte­
gration had made impressive strides in the late 1980s and early 1990s. 
Nevertheless, EU social policy remained limited and secondary. The 
welfare states of Western Europe had defended themselves remark­
ably well, while the European welfare state was little more than a 
‘nightwatchman state’. The conclusion which I drew from this 
conflictual and uncertain state of affairs was that the earlier social 
democratic debates on the transition from the national welfare state 
to some form of Europeanized welfare state had been misconceived. 
The relationship between national-level social policies and the EU level 
was much more complicated than those earlier debates assumed. Con­
sequently, analysing this relationship was not just a simple matter of 
observing the transference of policy capabilities from the national to 
the European level, but a complex one of charting the interplay be­
tween the two. 

Following the completion of my work on the relationship between 
the British and Norwegian Labour Parties and the EU and my accept­
ance of employment in the Department of Politics at the University of 
Liverpool in 1996, I began to explore the development of EU social 
policy and its relationship to national-level social policy. Through my 
studies and having to teach the subject to inquisitive undergraduate 
and graduate students, I quickly made two discoveries: I was unhappy 
with the existing works on EU social policy; in order to truly come to 
grips with the whole complex area of EU social policy, one had to 
pursue a difficult two-step strategy. First, one had to have an accurate 
picture or ‘map’ of EU social policy. Second, with this map, one could 
then turn to the particular national arenas and examine how EU social 
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policy interacted with member states’ social policies. The difficulty in 
the first step lies in the need to focus on European policy develop­
ments without ignoring national factors too much, while the difficulty 
in the second lies in the danger of undue concentration on national 
dynamics. 

I began my ‘first step’, mapping EU social policy, in 1997. My ‘sec­
ond step’ is in the planning stages. As I argue in my final chapter, I 
am certain that this type of study will be at the centre of the next wave 
of EU social policy research. In the end, my hope is that these two 
works will provide students and social policy activists with a thor­
ough understanding of EU social policy and its interrelationship with 
key national-level social policies. Moreover, as I argue below, I firmly 
believe that the future of EU social policy lies not with the occasional 
well-publicized actions of the Commission or Parliament, but with the 
small-scale, unheralded, daily activities of social policy activists and 
interest groups. Often operating on minimal budgets and under enor­
mous workloads, these groups quietly struggle to move social policies 
through the often Byzantine EU policy process. The results of their 
individual efforts are often minuscule, but the cumulative effect is es­
sential for maintaining the future of the ‘human face’ of Europe. 

Lastly, I would briefly like to express my thanks to a number of 
institutions and individuals. The University of Liverpool’s Research 
Development Fund provided essential funding for my research. Among 
my Liverpool colleagues, Andrew Geddes was extremely helpful in 
helping me obtain funding for the book, in reviewing several chapters 
and in just being a good friend. Beverly Springer helped to give me the 
confidence to start this project. Rebecca Harkin at Polity Press was 
everything a writer could look for in an editor. My father, Bill Geyer, 
whose ‘classical’ education far exceeds my own, significantly strength­
ened my grammatical and stylistic weaknesses. Friends and colleagues 
in Brussels, especially Ingrid Sogner, Eamonn Noonan, Arnhild Sauer 
and David Spence, provided me with a place to stay and special insights 
into the ‘real’ EU policy process. Special thanks need to be extended to 
the more than seventy interviewees in the Commission, Parliament, 
Council and social policy NGOs who freely gave their time and opin­
ions to an often befuddled academic. Most important, I would like to 
thank my wife, Sigrun Skogly, for her unwavering support and advice. 
Of course, all errors remain my own. 

An interactive website for this book with further EU social policy links, 
updated material and further information can be found at www.social-
science-forum.org 



Introduction 

The phenomenal growth of the European Union (EU) in the period 
after the Second World War and the remarkable acceleration of that 
growth in the 1980s and 1990s makes the need to understand the 
development and impact of EU policy areas on Western (and Eastern) 
European nation-states essential. This point is obvious in the areas of 
monetary, trade and economic policy. In other policy areas, particu­
larly social policy, the role of the EU seems much less important, sec­
ondary at best, insignificant at worst. A cursory view of the early history 
of EU social policy would seem to support its subordinate role. The 
few paragraphs in the founding treaties of the EU, minor policy devel­
opment in the 1950s and 1960s and the aborted expansion of social 
policy in the early 1970s characterize the insubstantial nature of early 
EU social policy development. However, with the revival of European 
integration in the late 1980s under the Single European Act and in the 
early 1990s with the Maastricht Treaty, EU social policy experienced 
a remarkable expansion and growth of influence. Through new docu­
ments such as the Social Charter, Social Dimension and Social Proto­
col, EU policies regarding labour, gender, social inclusion and so on 
rapidly expanded. This recent expansion raises two key questions. Why 
did this expansion occur and can it be sustained? Is the growth of EU 
social policy a positive development? 

For the first question, interpretations of traditional European inte­
gration theories diverge strongly. For intergovernmentalists, represent­
ing the realist view of international relations, EU social policy, like 
European integration in general, is doomed to move in a Sisyphean1 

cycle of near success, then collapse. For them, deluded Europeanists 
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and social policy supporters have continually tried to create substan­
tial EU social policy through the founding treaties, EU organizations 
and specific pieces of EU legislation. However, despite their best at­
tempts, EU social policy has always been undercut by resistance from 
the member states, key interest groups (particularly European capi­
tal), by the institutional weakness of the EU, and by the feebleness of 
social policy within the EU itself. Hence, despite recent successes pro­
pelled by key member states, EU social policy is still subject to the will 
of the member states and is unlikely to make further sustainable ad­
vances. 

On the other hand, theorists coming out of the functionalist and 
neo-functionalist tradition would agree that EU social policy has been 
one of the most laggard areas of policy development. From the onset 
of the integration strategy, EU social policy has played a secondary 
role and often stagnated. Even today, it remains unevenly implemented 
and poorly financed. Key member states and interest groups have con­
tinually opposed its development. In spite of this, theorists would 
point out that due to the development of the EU, to the activities of the 
Commission and European interest groups and the impact of ‘spillover’, 
social policy has grown in scope, importance and influence, parallel­
ing the expanding significance and power of the EU itself. Consequently, 
social policy has managed to progress and should continue to do so 
for the foreseeable future. 

The answer to the question of whether EU social policy develop­
ment is positive depends on where one sits on the left–right political 
spectrum. Generally, for those on the right, particularly free-market 
liberals, the development of EU social policy has been counterproduc­
tive and a potentially dangerous threat. For them, the economic world 
changed in the 1980s and 1990s. Globalization has stripped Western 
European nation-states of their ability to control and regulate their 
economies, and survival in this fiercely competitive environment re­
quires embracing these new forces, reducing national-level controls, 
deregulating the economy and minimizing social constraints on the 
functioning of the market. Their support for European integration was 
based on the free market and deregulatory nature of the common 
market strategy. As the economies of the EU member states were in­
creasingly forced to open up to each other, European-level market 
forces would be unleashed, national-level social constraints would 
crumble and a reinvigorated European economy and society would 
emerge. EU social policy could undermine all of these potential gains 
by contradicting the basic deregulatory nature of the new era. It could 
enable nation-states to maintain existing social policies. It might even 
introduce new ones at both the national and European level. In short, 
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it represents the growth of the EU state beyond a minimalist, 
deregulatory, free-market framework. 

For others, particularly on the social democratic and Christian left, 
the growth of EU social policy has been both tardy and frail. They 
agree with those on the right that growing globalization put increas­
ing constraints on the economic controls and welfare states of the West 
European nations. As growth and tax revenues declined, unemploy­
ment and competition increased, putting a fiscal and political squeeze 
on national-level social policy. Social democrats had a growing sense 
that the era of the nationally based Keynesian welfare state had come 
to an end. As the EU was reinvigorated in the late 1980s and early 
1990s, these groups hoped that EU social policy would be capable of 
protecting Europe’s generally high level of social policy and provision 
from international competition, blunting the excesses (‘social dump­
ing’) of the free-market-oriented common market strategy, and possi­
bly laying the foundation for some form of new Euro-level welfare 
state structure as well as the Euro-market. 

In this book I argue that neither of the traditional theories adequately 
explain EU social policy development and the current left–right de­
bate over the impact of EU social policy is misdirected. As is argued in 
detail in chapters 1 and 2, EU social policy has developed, similar to 
the EU, due to a variety of factors. Despite its institutional weaknesses 
and the opposition of the member states, EU social policy has seen 
significant advances in the 1980s and 1990s. Moreover, due to its 
increased embeddedness in the EU institutional process, to the growth 
of EU social policy NGOs and the continued success of the larger inte­
gration project, EU social policy is likely to see further development in 
the foreseeable future. However, as chapters 3–8 demonstrate, this 
progress has been very uneven both over time and between the various 
sub-areas of social policy. In essence, no single theory can either fully 
explain or predict the development of EU social policy. The conclud­
ing chapter explores the complex and contingent nature of EU social 
policy. At present, a number of its key sub-areas appear set for further 
advances. Further, the larger European and international contexts seem 
to support further EU social policy developments. However, changes 
in the larger context and in the dynamic of key sub-areas could easily 
change. Recognizing this complexity and uncertainty is a key step in 
moving beyond the traditional debates. 

Obviously, this book cannot truly address the second question. The 
positive or negative nature of EU social policy hinges on the theoreti­
cal and moral position one takes towards welfare states and social 
policy in general. It is beyond the scope of this book to delve into the 
deep debates and numerous works on the nature and morality of the 



4 Introduction 

welfare state. Nevertheless, the left–right debate over EU social policy 
in the 1980s and early 1990s suffered from two related weaknesses: 
the debate often lacked detailed knowledge of the policy and its inter­
action with national social policy regimes; aggravated by this lack, the 
debate was premised on the assumption of the imminent collapse of 
national welfare states and the potential development of an EU wel­
fare state. As an increasing number of observers have recognized in 
the 1990s, national-level welfare states are not collapsing or converg­
ing. Moreover, the fears of or hopes for the creation of a European 
welfare state are both unfounded. Some EU social policy areas, par­
ticularly gender policy, have seen significant development and 
influence. At the same time, others, particularly policy for the elderly, 
remain inconsequential. The reality of EU social policy is a much more 
complex mix of success and failure. The aim of this book is to increase 
the general knowledge of EU social policy and to encourage social 
policy opponents and proponents to reassess their interpretations of 
EU social policy and shift away from a rather fruitless debate over the 
creation of an EU welfare state and towards the complex interaction 
between EU and member-state social policy regimes. In essence, the 
new European welfare state is not located at the EU level, but remains 
predominantly national. However, a new arena of social policy co­
operation, co-ordination and struggle has been opened up at the EU 
level. The more social policy actors are able to take advantage of this 
level, the more likely symbiotic relationships will develop between the 
national and EU policy levels. As a proponent of EU social policy, I 
hope that this shift in debate will allow for the focusing of research 
and political effort on exploring the potential of this symbiotic rela­
tionship. 

The strategy of the book 

The book’s titular objective of exploring EU social policy poses three 
questions. How do I define EU social policy? Why focus on EU social 
policy? What do I mean by ‘exploring’ EU social policy? 

Defining social policy is never easy. Richard Titmuss, one of the 
founders of the study of modern social policy, lamented, ‘this tiresome 
business of defining social policy’ (Titmuss, 1974: 28). A brief glance 
at any basic work on this topic would show the variety of theoretical 
interpretations and distinctive developments of differing national so­
cial policy regimes (Lavalette and Pratt, 1997). Moreover, the EU so­
cial policy regime’s very distinctive structure and dynamics further 
complicate the creation of a clear and concise definition. For example, 
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if one were to use T.H. Marshall’s classic definition of social policy as 
the use of ‘political power to supersede, supplement or modify opera­
tions of the economic system in order to achieve results which the 
economic system would not achieve on its own’ (Marshall, 1975: 15), 
then one could certainly argue that the most important and substan­
tial European social policy is EU agricultural policy. The Common 
Agricultural Policy (CAP) is a massive policy area, controlling nearly 
two-thirds of the EU budget and with its strategies of income support, 
market direction, education and training could easily be seen as using 
political power to shape economic outcomes. Lacking a clear theoreti­
cal model, I have chosen to use the EU’s practical definition of social 
policy, the activities of the Commission’s Directorate-General V (DGV) 
responsible for employment, industrial relations and social affairs, as 
my definition of the boundaries of EU social policy. Consequently, all 
the main areas of DGV activity are reflected in my chapter topics. 
There are obvious weaknesses in this strategy, one of which is that 
DGV’s activities have varied over time. For example, as this book goes 
to press it has just been announced that the responsibility for public 
health policy has been moved from DGV to DGXXIV. Nevertheless, 
DGV’s activities do provide a reasonable and traceable outline of EU 
social policy. 

Regarding the second question, one should ask how one can study 
EU social policy in isolation from the social policy of the various wel­
fare states of the member states. Clearly, EU social policy is related to 
the development of these welfare states. EU social policy has generally 
been built around the institutional structures of existing welfare states 
as a minimalist floor underneath existing social policy regulations and 
rules. Throughout most of the history of the EU, member states have 
maintained strict control over EU social policy though the unanimous 
voting (UV) procedures in the Council. Moreover, one of the most 
interesting elements of EU social policy is its relationship and impact 
on differing welfare state structures. While these are valid points, EU 
social policy has become so important that it not only deserves specific 
attention as a policy area in its own right, but it has also become 
sufficiently substantial as a policy area to fully occupy a book-length 
manuscript. Further, EU social policy, with the expansion of qualified 
majority voting (QMV) in the Council, its expanding base in the trea­
ties and the growing activity and influence of social policy NGOs, has 
increasingly escaped from direct control by member states. As such, it 
is essential to trace the emergence of this transition not from the per­
spective of the member states, but from that of the European level. 
This is not to say that national-level dynamics are unimportant or can 
be completely ignored. In this book, I often refer to national-level de-
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mands and dynamics. However, in order to trace the map of EU social 
policy, I could mention the national-level influences only briefly. As 
mentioned in the preface, this book is intended to ‘ m a p ’ the policy 
contours of EU social policy; my second work will rectify some of the 
national deficiencies that are inherent in this text. 

Third, what do I mean by ‘exploring’ social policy? There are two 
parts to my definition of exploration, my desire to explore beyond the 
limitations of existing works and my methodological approach. De­
spite its growing importance, academic understanding and debate on 
EU social policy remain surprisingly limited. The secondary position 
of EU social policy, the recent focus on economic and monetary inte­
gration and EU institutional blockages have combined to constrain 
the development of and interest in EU social policy. There are a few 
books that examine EU social policy. These include collections of es­
says that explore particular elements of EU social policy or bring to­
gether excellent published articles on different aspects or implications 
of that policy2 and other works which provide some degree of over­
view to the development and scope of social policy.3 Unfortunately, 
none of these works provides a comprehensive and up-to-date exami­
nation of the development, scope and theoretical impact of EU social 
policy. This book is meant to fill that gap. 

Exploration is also a good metaphor for my methodological ap­
proach. The study of EU social policy lies at the intersection of inter­
national relations, regional integration theory and comparative policy 
studies.4 What marks this intersection is the reliance on ‘historical in¬ 
stitutionalism’ and the ‘comparative approach’. Historical institutional¬ 
ism, an established theoretical perspective which significantly revived 
in the 1980s and 1990s,5 argues that the key nexus for policy develop­
ment is in the embedded historical policy legacies of central policy 
institutions. By focusing on the actors and developments within 
intermediate-level institutions, institutionalism provides the theoret­
ical ‘bridge between “ m e n who make history” and the “circumstances” 
under which they are able to do so’ (Rothstein, 1992: 35). Closely 
linked to historical institutionalism is the comparative approach.6 As 
opposed to a more behaviouralist and statistically oriented compar­
ative method, the comparative approach is less scientifically rigorous 
in that it tries to capture the complexity and interrelatedness of com­
parative politics and policy studies. As Jean Blondel wrote, the compar­
ative approach is ‘ a multi-pronged effort designed to come as close as 
possible to the many facets of the reality of the institutions, people, 
and countries which constitute the context within which government 
acts and develops’ (Blondel, 1981: 168). 

Essentially, this methodology assumes that the primary goal of re-
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search is to explore, rather than to prove. Mapping the development 
of EU social policy requires a knowledge and synthesis of earlier works, 
extensive analysis of primary documents and a detailed knowledge of 
the primary actors. Over the past two years, I am confident that I have 
reviewed all major English language texts on EU social policy, ob­
tained most of the major primary documents (an increasingly easy 
task due to the internet) and acquired first-hand knowledge through 
my interviews with EU social policy actors. 

Chapter outlines 

The choice of chapter topics and overall structure of the book reflect 
my desire to correct the limitations of the previous literature on EU 
social policy and lay a foundation for further research into the re­
lationship between EU and national-level social policy regimes. Chap­
ters 1 and 2 provide the fundamental historical and theoretical back­
ground for the later policy chapters. Chapter 1 begins with a brief 
definition and history of social policy and the limited international 
aspects of its development. It then briefly reviews the three major 
theories of European integration associated with the period after the 
Second World War: the federalist ‘vision’, functionalist ‘plan’, and 
neo-functionalist ‘spillover’, paying special attention to the role of so­
cial policy in each. Following this, the chapter explores the foundation 
of EU social policy in the Treaties of Paris (1951) and Rome (1957), 
and then turns to the limited developments in social policy during the 
late 1950s and 1960s and the theory of realism. The role of social 
policy in realist thinking was of minimal significance and was depend­
ent on the national interests of the various member states. The theory, 
sceptical of the development of the EU, fit well with the stagnation of 
the EU in the 1960s. 

Chapter 2 begins with a brief examination of the revival of social 
policy in the early 1970s under the 1974 Social Action Programme 
and follows the uneven development of social policy throughout the 
1970s and early 1980s. During this time, theoretical understanding of 
European integration and policy development shifted from the starkly 
pessimistic views of realism to the more cautiously optimistic opinions 
of confederalism. The chapter then examines the revival of the EU and 
EU social policy in the late 1980s and early 1990s under the Single 
European Act and 1992 Project, and explores the development of the 
Social Dimension, Social Charter, 1989 Social Action Programme and 
the impact of the EU Commission led by Jacques Delors. During this 
period, debates focused on the nature of and need for EU social policy. 
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Generally, free-market conservatives argued against it, and social demo­
crats for it. The final section of chapter 2 discusses the most recent EU 
social policy developments, the growth of a more pluralist form of EU 
social policy formation7 and the theoretical transition from macro- to 
meso-level theorizing. 

Chapters 3 and 4 focus on the crucial areas of EU labour policy. Of 
the various areas of EU social policy, labour policy is probably the 
most contentious. It reflects deep philosophical divisions within Euro­
pean politics and society, attracts powerful, committed and determined 
interest groups (capital and labour) and is obviously extremely impor­
tant to the functioning of the advanced industrial economies of West­
ern Europe. Chapter 3 explores the less controversial ‘core’ policies of 
freedom of movement of labour and health and safety policy. These 
were built into the earliest EU treaties, both as a strategy for creating a 
true European market and as a way of reassuring wary workers that 
their economic and social position would not be eroded by labour 
market integration. Of primary interest is the way in which these ar­
eas were used as ‘Trojan horses’ to bring in other areas of EU labour 
and social policy. 

Chapter 4 explores the main extensions to EU labour policy that 
emerged after the 1970s. These included the development of policies 
in the areas of employment rights and working conditions, worker 
participation and the social dialogue. These areas emerged in the af­
termath of the 1974 Social Action Programme and were justified 
through direct and indirect reference to the core areas of labour policy. 
Promoted by DGV in the EU Commission, the Parliament, socialist 
parties (at the national and European level) and European trade un­
ions, these areas saw some degree of success, particularly during the 
late 1980s and early 1990s. Although all of them have now become 
firmly established within the field of EU social policy, their current 
strength and potential for continued expansion vary substantially. 

Chapter 5 concerns the fascinating development of EU gender policy. 
From its beginning in Article 119 in the Treaty of Rome, ratified on 1 
January 1958, through the remarkable European Court of Justice (ECJ) 
cases of the 1980s to the present ‘mainstreaming’ of gender issues, EU 
gender policy has been one of the most impressive areas of social policy 
development. Spurred on by the growth of ‘second wave’ feminism in 
Western Europe, an increasingly effective women’s group lobbying 
organization, as well as the breakdown of the traditional family struc­
ture and male-dominated occupational structure, gender policy has 
made enormous strides since the 1970s. By the 1980s, gender policy 
had become a well-funded policy area with a significant and growing 
legal base. In the 1990s it proved to be one of the most important 
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social policy areas and was increasingly ‘mainstreamed’ into other 
policy areas. 

In chapter 61 move from the most successful area of EU social policy 
to the wealthiest, the EU Structural Funds, in particular the European 
Social Fund (ESF). In the current funding period (1994–9), the struc­
tural funds have planned to allocate a total of 138 billion ECU, of 
which the ESF intend to allocate around 42 billion ECU.8 In many 
ways, this is the heart of the European social project. From its very 
inception in the 1957 Treaty of Rome, the ESF was intended to ‘im­
prove employment opportunities for workers’, primarily through en­
couraging mobility, vocational training and unemployment aid. As 
the EU progressed, the Structural Funds and the ESF expanded and 
moved into wider policy areas, created a more European orientation 
and profile, and developed a multitude of distinctive projects and pro­
grammes. A key focus of this chapter is the difference between past 
and present policy roles of the Structural Funds and the ESF. Are they 
regional or social policies, or are they just bribes for the weaker mem­
ber states and social groups to keep them committed to the larger 
integration project? 

Chapter 7 looks at three of the most recent areas of EU social policy 
expansion: those on anti-poverty/social inclusion, anti-race discrimi­
nation against racism and on public health. Though anti-poverty policy 
has its roots in the 1970s, it was not until the late 1980s that these 
three policy areas begin to develop at the EU level. In the 1990s these 
policy areas have experienced different levels of success. Anti-poverty 
policy development looked extremely promising in 1993 with the ex­
panding budget of the Fourth Poverty Programme and the burgeoning 
concepts of social inclusion/exclusion. However, following the Coun­
cil’s rejection of the programme in 1994, the policy area has stag­
nated. Anti-discrimination policy against racism has always had a 
delicate position in the EU system. The EU has been reluctant to ac­
cept responsibility for a difficult policy area, while the member states 
have been unwilling to cede authority over it. Nevertheless, respond­
ing to the rise of far right parties in the 1980s and racist crimes in the 
early 1990s (particularly in Germany and France), the EU began to 
develop more anti-discrimination legislation against racism and has 
recently inserted an anti-discrimination Article into the 1997 Amster­
dam Treaty. Finally, public health policy emerged out of particular 
health issues of the 1980s and 1990s: drug dependence; cancer (par­
ticularly where linked to smoking); AIDS; health promotion; and in­
formation. Emphasizing the importance of member-state co-operation 
and the information and research orientation of this policy area, the 
EU has pushed into the field of public health with relative ease. With 
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the continued importance of these health issues and the commitments 
made by the Amsterdam Treaty to further European public health, 
this is one EU social policy area which will probably expand. 

Chapter 8 examines the emergence of three policy areas linked to 
specific social groups, the elderly, the disabled and the young. Of these 
three, the policy for the elderly has been the least successful within the 
EU policy process. Ignored in the founding treaties, not recognized 
until the 1974 Social Action Programme and only occasionally referred 
to in related policy areas of social inclusion and social protection dur­
ing the 1970s and 1980s, elderly policy did not establish itself until 
the 1988 Social Charter, the 1989 Social Action Programme and sub­
sequent action programmes. Its failure to gain a firm base in the 
Maastricht and Amsterdam treaties demonstrates its continued weak­
ness. Similarly, disability policy made no significant appearance in EU 
social policy until the early 1970s. Following the 1974 Social Action 
Programme, a series of action programmes were created to improve 
the condition of the disabled in Europe. By the late 1980s, disability 
policy had firmly established itself in the programmatic side of EU 
social policy, but had yet to make significant legislative developments. 
Though the disabled were ignored by the Maastricht Treaty, the Am­
sterdam Treaty and subsequent Employment Guidelines did recognize 
their needs. Finally, some aspects of youth policy have been deeply 
rooted and very successful in the EU social policy process. Areas such 
as vocational training, student mobility, and employment promotion 
for the young have been core elements of EU policy since the Treaty 
of Rome. These areas of youth policy have substantial roots in the 
treaties, particularly the Maastricht Treaty, and are supported by sub­
stantial funding from the Structural Funds. However, outside these 
traditional areas, youth policy has seen little or no development. 

The final chapter opens with a brief summary of the current ‘map’ 
of EU social policy. I then explore how EU social policy is not like 
national-level social policy, how it has become primarily regulatory, 
exhibiting a variety of policy dynamics, not significantly replacing or 
undermining national social policy regimes. I conclude with a discus­
sion of the next wave of EU social policy research and the uncertain 
future of EU social policy. 
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European Social Policy 
1950–1969 

[The Commission] cannot conceive that the Community has not got 
a social purpose. 

EEC, Second General Report, 19581 

This then is the sum total of social policy measures in the Treaty of 
Rome: a whiff of society-creating measures in Articles 2, 117 and 
118; a gesture towards harmonisation in Articles 119 and 120; and a 
strong element of functional social policy to encourage the mobility 
of labour, and the retraining of workers through the ESF. 

Hoskyns, Integrating Gender 

How is it that such divergent views could be held over the role of 
social policy in the early years of the EU? Was social policy at the 
heart of the early treaties of Paris and Rome that laid the foundation 
for the ECSC and the EEC? Or was social policy an afterthought used 
to placate the threatened in the integration process? Moreover, what 
role did social policy play in early integration theory? This chapter 
attempts to explore these questions. It starts with a review of the 
key social policy developments at the international level and within 
the ECSC and EEC member states in the years immediately after the 
Second World War. I then examine three early integration theories, 
federalism, functionalism and neo-functionalism as well as their inter­
pretation of EU social policy, succeeded by an analysis of the role of 
social policy in the treaties of Paris and Rome, and a brief overview of 
major social policy developments. In conclusion I argue that EU social 
policy has been an uncertain and controversial policy since its crea­
tion. It has generally had a secondary role in relation to the larger goal 
of economic integration, but was expected to become increasingly im­
portant as integration progressed. 


